Heat 1 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 28.94 Distances : 5L, 8L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 2 Direct Current 3.65 | Evaw,Rnon 1800 No

4 4 Miss Clarkson 3.70 | BmpruRnon €500 Yes

6 Bower Ace Hi 3.59 | Faw,Ald €4,500 Yes

Heat 2 Result: 4-2-6 Time : 29.08 Distances : 7L, 1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
6 2 Payday Torres 3.67 | Qaw,Finwl No Bid | No

9 4 Mountnagle Dusty 3.62 | Qaw,Ald €1,300 | Yes

11 6 Dusty Lily 3.64 | Faw,Rnon €300 | Yes
Heat 3 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.39 Distances: 0.5L, 7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
12 2 Carbon Blackjack 3.58 | Evaw,Chlri 400 No

13 4 Bower Hi Ace 3.56 | Faw,Rnon €800 Yes

15 6 Unknow Zag 3.50 | Qaw,Rnon NoBid | No
Heat 4 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.16 Distances: 3L,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
16 2 Roseville Sparky 343 | Evaw, Ald 4,000 2,500 | NO

17 4 Took The Lee 3.56 | BIkd I, Finwl €600 Yes

18 6 Teach Beag 3.61 | Slaw, Rnon 600 NO
Heat 5 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.06 Distances: 3L, 5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
20 2 Favounius 3.51 | Evaw,Styon €1,000 | Yes

21 4 Unknown Lulu 3.50 | Bmp 2,Rnon | 1,000 300 No

22 6 Gurrane Snapper 3.50 | Bmp 2 Rnon €750 | Yes
Heat 6 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.55 Distances: 2L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
23 2 Took The Ferry 3.58 | Qaw,Chlri €450 | Yes

24 4 Break The Cycle 3.46 | Faw, Hldon 1,000 | NO

25 6 Barleyfield Lass 3.57 | Evaw,Rnon No Bid | NO
Heat 7 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.54 Distances: 4L,5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
29 2 Unknown Crafty 3.56 | Evaw,Rnon * NO

30 |4 Swiftly Special 3.54 | Evan, Mid * NO

27 6 Corranstone Eric (W) 3.54 | Evan, Ald 400 NO

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 8 Result: 4-6-2  Time: 29.23 Distances: 2L,3L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
31 2 Runway Four 3.51 | Bmpru, Rnon €700 | Yes
33 4 Whitty Midnight 3.48 | Bmpru, Ld1 600 NO
34 6 Laharn Dicaprio 3.64 | Msdbk,Finwl €700 | Yes
Heat 9 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.50 Distances: 4L,2L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
35 2 Vickis Pal 3.50 | Faw,Mid, * NO
37 4 Unknow View 3.56 | Qaw,Rnon * NO
38 6 Satin Tom 3.71 | Evaw,Finwl €1,400 | Yes
Heat 10 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.09 Distances: 6L, 6L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
39 2 Swiftly Prince 3.51 | Qaw,Fdri * NO
40 4 Ferryforth Cech 3.52 | Qaw,Rnon No Bid | No
41 6 Cissies Bambino 3.60 | Slaw,Finwl €1,000 | Yes
Heat 11 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.59 Distances: 3L,1L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
42 2 Witches Sun 3.62 | Evaw,Rnon €200 | Yes SOB
45 4 Mountkeeffe Hondo 3.56 | Qaw,Ald €1,100 | Yes
46 6 Front Row 3.63 | Evaw,Rnon €400 Yes
Heat 12 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.17 Distances: 2L,1L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
47 2 Satin Johnny 3.62 | Evaw,Rnon €700 | Yes
49 4 Baby Vee 3.54 | Qaw,Chlri €600 | Yes
48 6 Only Aces (W) 3.59 | Qaw,Ald €1,200 | Yes
Heat 13 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.26 Distances: 3L,0.5L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
50 2 Cute Primrose 3.50 | Faw,Fdri 450 No
51 4 Honey Croc 3.51 | Evaw,Ld2 700 No
53 6 Mikey Paddy 3.64 | Evaw,Rnon €350 Yes
Heat 14 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.13 Distances: 8L, 4L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
55 2 Curryhills Snops 3.65 | Slaw,Rnon * NO
58 4 Canadian Dave 3.45 | Faw,Ald €3,000 | Yes
56 6 Serrano Joe (W) 3.50 | Qaw,A2nd 800 No

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 15 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.01 Distances : 2L,1L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
59 2 Early Contact 3.56 | Evaw,Chlri €2,700 | Yes
61 4 Bearhaven Fox 3.54 | Qaw,Hldon €2,800 | Yes
62 6 Lesotho Promise (W) | 3.48 | Qaw,Mid * No
Heat 16 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.00 Distances: 1L,5L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
64 2 Loving Customer 3.58 | Evaw,Rnon * No
65 4 Fouroutoffive 3.49 | Qaw,Chlri 500 No
66 6 Glasha Woods 3.44 | Faw,Ald €3,200 | Yes
Heat 17 Result: 4-2 Time: 29.40 Distances: 7L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
69 2 Pretty Sunshine 3.51 | Qaw,Rnon €400 | Yes SOB
70 4 Babby Joe 3.48 | Qaw,Finwl €450 | Yes SOB
6
Heat 18 (330) Result: Solo Time: 18.66 Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
68 2 Shift Sky Blues No Bid | No
4
6

* Not Presented for Sale




